Date: Fri, Apr 22, 2022 at 2:33 PM
Subject: Re: PG&E payment
To: Beatley, Jessica <JessicaBeatley@countyofplumas.com>

Thank you, Jessica. | am filling the Chiefs position for the near future. My email is
jwaterman@chesterfire.org. Thank you!
Joe Waterman

On Tue, Apr 19, 2022 at 9:28 AM Beatley, Jessica <JessicaBeatley@countyofplumas.com> wrote:

Good morning,

My name is Jessica Beatley and I’'m an Investigator for the Plumas County District Attornéy's Office. Our
county has reached a settlement with PG&E and they have been ordered to pay the Plumas County Fire
Departments $1,000,000. This money will be split evenly between the departments. Your contact
information has been provided to PG&E and they are required to make their first payment (30%) within
30 days of 4/11/22 and the remaining 70% on 7/12/22. Please feel free to contact our office with any
questions. ¥ ¢
Thanks,

Jessica

Jessica Beatley
Investigations Specialist

Plumas County District Attorney’s Office



Pacific Gas and s THE BANK OF NEW YORK MELLON ~ 53-292

. o - 77Beale Street, : 113
Electric Company” &, ?faius’ff CA 84705
Date: 05/06/2022 Check No. 45868084 Pay $****15.000.00*
*FIFTEEN THOUSAND**#** b FERIL AR * AND.00/100 DOLLARS
To The Order OF ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
ggEgTERSEgBLIC UTILITY DISTRICT Pacific Gas and
[¢ D¢ . ®
CHESTER CA 96020 Electric Company

Invoice
INVCPUD1

Totals:

PLEASE FOLD FIRST THEN DETACH ALONG PERFORATION

6608020

CHESTER PUBLIC UTILITY DISTRICT
Check no. 4968084
Date 05/06/2
Your account number '
Payment Document
Our account with you

Date Discount Net Amount Comments
05/06/22 0.00 15,000.00
usD 0.00 15,000.00 For Payment Inguiries, email APPaidLine@pge.com

Special Handle Code:

Pacific Gas and Electric Company 77 Beale Street, San Francisco, CA 94105 Not Negotiable



